

Bid Opening Worksheet
2020 Roadway Improvement Program
City of Oregon, Ohio

Date: Thursday, February 20, 2020

Opened By: Paul Roman, P.E.

Time: 10:00 a.m.

Witnesses: R. Shultz, P.E., B. Biniker, P.E., J. Bosh

Engineer's Estimate:		\$410,000	\$64,000	\$586,000	\$80,000	\$200,000	\$100,000	\$48,000	\$50,000	
Contractor	Bid Guarantee	Project #1	Project #1 Alternate A	Project #2	Project #3	Project #4	Project #5	Project #5 Alternate A	Project #6	Notes
Henry W. Bergman, Inc.	10%	No Bid	No Bid	\$508,525.15	\$69,469.00	\$212,554.00	\$89,589.20	\$52,743.00	\$60,694.50	
Schoen, Inc.	10%	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$108,464.00	\$52,526.00	No Bid	
Helms & Sons Excavating, Inc.	Penal	\$385,319.00	\$51,423.55	\$463,244.20	\$30,087.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
The Shelly Company	Penal	\$421,413.45	\$67,055.00	\$508,329.15	No Bid	\$259,006.75	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Geddis Paving & Excavating, Inc.	Penal	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$250,077.50	\$109,016.45	\$57,366.00	\$74,180.90	
Bowers Asphalt & Paving, Inc.	Penal	\$378,701.25	\$61,339.00	\$518,678.75	\$92,830.00	\$224,084.75	\$140,065.50	\$50,889.00	\$69,859.00	
Gerken Paving, Inc.	Penal	\$402,652.20	\$66,235.80	\$498,501.05	\$79,009.00	\$237,896.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Kokosing Construction Company, Inc.	Penal	No Bid	No Bid	\$475,793.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Crestline Paving & Excavating Co., Inc.	Penal	\$434,380.95	\$68,985.45	\$598,764.30	\$76,535.00	No Bid	\$103,767.70	\$50,286.05	No Bid	
Geo. Gradel Co.	Penal	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$228,900.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Bid Tab Results Will Be Available on the City's Web site at www.oregonhio.org (Click on Bidding Information)										